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Construction starts rolling on new S.T.E.M. Building
By Tia Truchel
Centurion Staff 

Construction has finally started 
on the Science, Technology, 
Engineering, and Mathematics 
(STEM) building. 

 According to Bucks presi-
dent, Dr. Stephanie Shanblatt, 
the building is scheduled to be 
completed and open with access 
to students by Jan. of 2017. 

Shanblatt states, “We have a 
very strong STEM program here 
at Bucks. One of the things that 
we want to ensure is that along 
with our strong program, is that 
our students have access to up 
to date and modern laboratory 
facilities.” 

This building is mainly going 
to establish larger and more 
equipped laboratories in order 
for the students to have more 
space to be successful in their 
time here at Bucks. Some of 
the new labs are even going to 
be partially detailed with glass 
looking in from the hallways.

 Shanblatt says that this will 
create a “wonderful learning 
environment” and also enable 
students to be more open to 
the sciences. The labs will be 
designed so students will be able 

to see what is going on inside 
and create an open and more 
intriguing atmosphere, rather 
than having the rooms be closed 
off and hidden. 

This building will hopefully 
bring forth a number of new 
students and be able to create a 

more efficient learning environ-
ment while also making students 
feel more involved. 

Shanblatt says, “For the stu-
dents actually in the lab, I think 
that just being in spaces where 
the ceilings are much higher 
than they are in the current lab, 

and there is much more natural 
light creates a great learning 
environment for the students. It 
will open up science to students 
to otherwise might have been a 
little wary.” 

The main reason the building 
is being produced is to transfer 

the student’s labs from Founders, 
and broaden capacity by creating 
a newer and more productive 
work facility. The same staff will 
also continue teaching in these 
new labs, but with their offices 
still be kept in Founders. 

The building is going to cost 
$17 million dollars total and 
is planned to be paid off over 
twenty years through bonds. It is 
being funded half by the county 
and half by the state. 

Providing more space is key in 
the production of the new build-
ing and with more lab space, 
more sections will be offered 
strengthening and broadening 
the science program at Bucks.

 The STEM building is going 
to have a grand opening includ-
ing a ribbon cutting ceremony. 
Also, student tours will be pro-
vided and open for new students 
to be able to get a feel for the 
potential courses offered in the 
sciences program. 

Shanblatt states, “I think our 
science building will rival any 
other college, two or four year. 
It will be first hand and a terrific 
experience!”
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Introducing new majors with new options for students
By: Peterson Prime
Centurion Staff

Starting this fall, in an effort 
to provide its student with more 
choices of majors and to boost 
enrollment, Bucks has added five 
new majors.

Before this new addition, 
Bucks already offered close to 
80 academic majors.  Despite 
this wide array of choices, there 
were not specific programs for 
students with a strong interest 
in history, exercise science or 
photography.  

Those students, now, know 
exactly the courses they would 
need to take in order to acquire 
an associate degree.  For those 
students who do not want to 
pursue an associate degree but 
still want to have a meaningful 
career, they could elect to major 

in early childhood education and 
medical assistant.  

Starting this fall, in an effort 
to provide its student with more 
choices of majors and to boost 
enrollment, Bucks has added five 
new majors.

Before this new addition, 
Bucks already offered close to 
80 academic majors.  Despite 
this wide array of choices, there 
were not specific programs for 
students with a strong interest 
in history, exercise science or 
photography.  

Those students, now, know 
exactly the courses they would 
need to take in order to acquire 
an associate degree.  For those 
students who do not want to 
pursue an associate degree but 
still want to have a meaningful 

career, they could 
elect to major in 
early childhood ed-
ucation and medical 
assistant.  

Once these 
students fulfill all 
the requirements of 
these two majors, 
they receive a cer-
tificate.

Institutional Re-
search, the research 
arm of the college, 
has provided data 
on two of the newly 
offered majors.  
They showed that 
there has been an 
increasing number 
of students who has 
chosen History as 
their major.  In the 

fall of 2014, the number was 
four; in spring 2015, it was 13; 
this semester, the number jumps 
to 33. For photography, there 
has been a consistent number of 
students who have declared it as 
their major.  It was 32 for both 
fall 2014 and spring 2015.  The 
number stands at 28 for this fall 
semester.

Before the announcement 
of those five new majors, the 
process that led to their adoption 
was meticulous.  In an interview, 
John Totten, Dean of the Social 
and Behavioral Studies Depart-
ment, shed light on the steps that 
Bucks generally takes in evaluat-
ing the need for a new major.

The process, which usually 
last about a year, started at the 
departmental level.  

Continued on pg. 2
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Introducing new majors with new options for students
This is where a proposed ma-

jor originates. 
  The next step is the 

most critical in the process.  
The Committee on Curricular 
Revision and Review (CCRR), 
which is made up of both faculty 
and administration members, an-
alyzes the merits of the request.  

In evaluating that request, the 
CCRR uses a rigorous method-
ology in its analysis.  First the 
CCRR consults two important 

sources: the Bureau of Labor 
Statistics and economic model 
software in order to gauge the 
employability of a holder of the 
proposed major.  

Moreover, the CCRR also 
examines a range of data that 
Institutional Research collects.  
Those data include the follow-
ing: number of majors; gradua-
tion rate; exit interview.  

During its evaluation of the 
proposed major, the exit inter-

view could be of great interest 
since students usually convey a 
fi eld of study that they want to 
go into but Bucks has not yet 
offered. 

Equally important, the CCRR 
analyzes data which show what 
kinds of majors are popular 
among students who attend four-
year universities in the state.

After its thorough review, the 
CCRR sent its recommenda-
tions to the Advisory Council, 

which has also both faculty and 
administration members for fur-
ther review.  The council could 
take two decisions.  The council 
could engage in a back and forth 
with the CCRR if its member 
have questions about the fi nd-
ings; or if the council does not 
have any questions or is satisfi ed 
by the fi ndings, the proposal will 
be submitted to the president for 
fi nal approval.

Clubapalooza gets Bucks students involved! 
BY: MEGAN HOLMES, 
Centurion Staff

On Tuesday September the 2nd 
and Wednesday September the 
3rd, a mass of students gathered 
in and around Bucks’ Cafeteria to 
display the school’s various clubs 
and organizations. The event 
pushed for students to get active 
with BCCC’s extracurricular 
activities.

The cafeteria was fi lled with 
tables and stands that contained 
signs and signup sheets for clubs 
such as the Future Teachers Or-
ganization, the Drama Club, the 
Open Door Club,

During the time when foot 
traffi c was slow, club members 
took the time to talk amongst 
themselves and other club rep-
resentatives. Once lunch hours 
hit, herds of students made their 
way through the cafeteria, and 
to the various club tables. Many 
students who usually just pass 
by while walking to their next 
destination, slowed down to take 
a look at what was happening. 
Some even got inspired and 
signed up for one or more clubs. 

Students from all walks of life 
could fi nd an activity to connect 

with. Despite the different styles, 
backgrounds, skill levels, and 
interests, students had the oppor-
tunity to get plugged in at Bucks. 

Music major, Naomi Thomp-
son, 18, from the Feasterville 
area, signed up for a couple 
different clubs and said “I came 
to the club fair looking for a new 
diverse group of friends and a 
purpose at this college.” She 
claimed to love the different vari-
ety of clubs offered on campus.

Childcare major Becky Jones, 

26, from Newtown, was one of 
the individuals representing the 
Photography Club. She said she 
thought that the Palooza is a 
very effective way of revealing 
the different clubs on campus. 
However, she also mentioned 
that maybe before it takes place, 
the Palooza should be better 
advertised. She overheard many 
people who were passing by say 
they knew nothing about it.

After asking her what the 
Photography club was about, she 

said that all photographers with 
any genre of work are welcome 
to come showcase and talk about 
the photographs that they take.

She mentioned that the club 
was “hoping to do a project in 
October called Philadelphia 
Photo Day” where any of their 
photos could be entered in the 
Philadelphia Art Center.

Sarah Wingad, 18, and Crim-
inal Psychology major, and 
Gabrielle Leposki, 21, repre-
sentatives of the Inter-varsity 
Christian Club say that they 
think the Palooza is an effective 
way for all clubs to get noticed 
because so many people walk by 
the area where the stands are all 
centralized. 

“The group is about growing 
closer to Jesus and learning more 
about Him.” Said Gabrielle about 
the Inter-varsity Christian Club. 
Sarah went on to say, “This is 
like a spiritual refuge in college 
life.”

While some seem to love the 
Palooza, there are those, like 
Naomi, who say it is effective 
but needs to be more advertised: 
“I didn’t know about it and 
would not have known about it if 
friends of mine weren’t a part of 
clubs.”

with. Despite the different styles, 

Students talk about dif� culties buying textbooks
BY: JOHNNY COHEN
Centurion Staff

The ‘Black Friday’ equivalent 
of school shopping has passed, 
and most students have obtained 
the required textbooks for their 
classes. Once again, the helpful 
staff at the Bucks Bookstore has 
assisted those who were strug-
gling to get all of their books on 
time. 

Haleigh Morgan, Campus 
Relations representative for the 
Bucks Bookstore and Follett, 
(the company which the Book-
store operates through) states, 
“There has been a lot of change 
this summer, from store leader-
ship to shopping experience.

“In July, Joe Judge joined 
BCCC Bookstore as the new 
store manager and Bob Micha-
lis also joined as the new text 
manager. Both bring extensive 
campus retail experience to their 
new roles”.  

Additionally, the search data-
base and layout of the fl oor has 
made shopping for textbooks a 
swift experience for most. 

Environmental Science major, 

Devon Longmore, 21, of Holland 
says, “What I like about the 
Bookstore is that it’s relatively 
easy to fi nd what you’re looking 
for; it’s very organized…they 
have a great selection of other 
miscellaneous items and school 
supplies, which is also conve-
nient”.  

The Bookstore has also un-
dergone some physical changes, 
adding a new atmosphere to 
shopping.  Ms. Morgan states, 
“The bookstore underwent a 
remodel with new fi xtures, new 
carpet and new paint throughout. 
The upgrades will continue with 
new lighting, a music/intercom 
system and a mural to be painted 
behind the cash register area. 
The mural will be of students in 
front of local campus buildings 
to promote and celebrate BCCC 
culture/life within the store”.

Chef Apprentice, Kaylah Vine-
sky, 19, of Morrisville states, 
“I’ve heard of a great site called 
slugbooks.com, where you can 
search your book, and it will give 
you websites to compare prices 
for both renting and buying.”

Having instead used the Bucks 

Bookstore as her resource, 
she went on to say, “I needed 
everything on-hand, and needed 
to make sure that my books were 
correct…Thankfully I have a 
book voucher;  it’s one of the 
saving graces of the bookstore.”

In other instances, those who 
take courses which require online 
labs are feeling pushed into pur-
chasing new products. Business 
Administration major, Anthony 
Iaccarino, 21, of Chalfont says, 
“I spent about three to four hun-
dred dollars on new books, but 
that was including the internet 
access codes that cost well over a 
hundred dollars.”

For many however, the alter-
native to buying books at the 
bookstore was to get them off 
the web. The reason: retail prices 
are simply too high for most full 
time students. Kelly states, “My 
anatomy and nutrition books 
were over a hundred dollars to 
rent them in the bookstore, so I 
rented both of those off of Chegg 
and Amazon.”

The problem with purchasing 
books offl ine is typically that 
while they are a much more 

reasonable price through third 
party-distributors, textbooks 
won’t reach the doorstep for 
several weeks. English major, 
Andrew Anthony, 19, of Yard-
ley states, I primarily go to the 
bookstore for the convenience 
because it’s right there; but it’s 
very overpriced.”

Haleigh Morgan states, “We 
are committed to delivering the 
right course materials at the right 
time and in the right formats. 
This fall, the bookstore saw in-
creases in rental and digital book 
sales. We anticipate this trend 
will continue next term as stu-
dents continue to explore formats 
beyond the traditional new and 
used books.”

Students also struggle to return 
books on time. Devon Longmore 
states, “I was trying to get some 
of my books online, but I needed 
to get most of them that week; so 
I couldn’t wait for the shipping 
to go through…They only give 
you two days to return the book, 
and they can’t be opened or any-
thing. So at that point it’s having 
a book to show that you have a 
book.”

September 17
-Fall 2015 withdraw period 

begins
-Men’s Soccer vs. Mont-

gomery 3:30pm @ Bucks
-Women’s Soccer vs. Mont-

gomery 3:30pm @ Montgom-
ery 

-Women’s Volleyball vs. Lu-
zerne 7pm @ Luzerne Gym 

-Women’s Tennis vs. Rowan 
College 3:30pm @ Bucks 

September 18
-Women’s Tennis vs. Mercer 

3:30pm @ Mercer Tennis 
Courts

-Men’s Gold @ Lackawan-
na 10am @ Stonehedge Golf 
Course

-Call of the Wild Art Exhibit 
6-8:30pm @ Lower Bucks

September 19
- Women’s Soccer vs. Ocean 

12pm @ Ocean Soccer Field
-Women’s Volley Ball vs. 

Valley Forge/CC of Philadel-
phia 11am @ Bucks Gym

-Women’s Tennis vs. Ocean 
12pm @ Bucks Tennis Courts

September 21
-Women’s Tennis vs. 

Camden 3:30pm @ Camden 
Tennis Courts

September 22
-Men’s Soccer vs. Deleware 

County Community College 
3:30pm @ Deleware County 
Community College Soccer 
Field
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Student Government Association brings new attractions 
By: Lauren Savana
Centurion Staff

Sitting in on the SGA meet-
ing in the student life center at 
12:30 on Sept. 8 felt overall like 
being part of a real congressional 
meeting. Vocal students interact-
ed with one another positively, 
yet still challenged one another. 
They all share one significant 
goal; to make this school a better 
place.

 	 SGA President Matthew 
Kelly, 21, South Hampton, is ma-
joring in business. He stated,“I 
want students at Bucks to feel 
like this is more than just a trans-
fer school.” 

SGA members spent the sum-
mer budgeting for the year so the 
proceeds go back to the clubs. 

Vice President Elizabeth 
Mortimer is working with the 
Bucks scholarship program to 
inform students about certain 
scholarships and make them 
more attainable. “Some of these 
scholarships no one even knows 

about, the money just sits there 
and doesn’t get used.” Mortimer 
said. 

The director of student life, 
Matt Cipriano, is in the process 
of creating an application for stu-
dents called Word Sync. This app 
will be as simple as searching 
the club that you are interested 
in, then it will show when and 
where the club meets.

Another great incentive for 
students is the 3.25 cards SGA 
designed. Students with a 3.25 
GPA or higher will receive these 
cards, which will allow them to 
get discounts at the bookstore. 
Although it can not be used for 
textbooks, it can be used for 
access codes needed for certain 
books, pens, notebooks, or even 
a quick snack.

Many events are in the works 
for this school year. The SPA 
(Student Program Association) 
plans these events, the SGA just 
helps in anyway they can. 

There is an optional communi-
ty service event on Oct. 18 from 
1p.m. to 6p.m. at Wine Fest. 
Students can help serve hors 
d’oeuvre’s for a few hours, then 
mingle and enjoy themselves.

 A talent show or an open mic 
is in the works as well. The past 
two talents shows have brought 
in over $4,000 for CHOP (Chil-
dren’s Hospital Of Philadelphia) 
and over $8,000 for scholarships. 
There are high hopes for how 
this year’s talent show or open 
mic will turn out.

Later this year there will be a 
bachelor/bachelorette auction. 
Those who wish to participate 
can sign up, write a small biog-
raphy about themselves, and then 
come up on stage to be auctioned 
off. All of the proceeds go to a 
charity of SGA’s choice. A large 
luncheon will happen after the 
biding. Everyone involved gets 
to sit down and share a meal 
together.

There are 12 students who are 
part of the SGA cabinet. Carol 
Brandt, administrative assistant 
of student life, said, “I’ve been 
here for 6 years and this is the 
first time I’ve seen this many 
students here.” 

Razin M. Karm, 25, Bensalem, 
majoring in History, reported, 
“I work thirty hours at one job, 
then twenty here at student life, 

while attending school full time.” 
These students are nothing but 
dedicated and determined. Bucks 
is lucky to have such passionate 
students in their student govern-
ment and has positive things to 
look forward to from SGA.
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Mysterious Syndrome Could Cause the Extinction of Bats

White-nose Syndrome is 
killing millions of bats and could 
cause them to become extinct.

Eco-Club plans to put up a bat 
box at Bucks’ Newtown campus 
in hopes of giving bats a place 
to roost at night and preventing 
them from becoming an endan-
gered species.

The club plans to build a 
shelter for bats that will be free 
from the disease that has been 
plaguing bat colonies recently. 
White-nose Syndrome is a fungal 
disease that has a very high mor-
tality rate. This fungus can poten-
tially kill an entire colony of bats 
during hibernation. Since 2006 
the disease has killed six million 
bats, and twenty-six states have 
confirmed the presence of the 
disease. 

WNS can be transferred from 
bat-to-bat contact or through 

infected caves and or mines. 
Cave-hibernating bats are espe-
cially susceptible. Many scien-
tists believe that WNS could lead 
to the extinction of bats within a 
decade.

Bats are essential to the eco-
system’s survival. Some species 
of bats pollinate plants and 
disperse plant seeds. They con-
sume insects that would destroy 
valuable crops and eat mos-
quitoes that could be carrying 
Malaria or the West Nile Virus. 
Although there is no cure for the 
disease, there is a treatment that 
keeps it from growing.

Ultimately, what the Eco-Club 
strives to do is keep species that 
are prone to this disease, like 
little and big brown bats, from 
becoming endangered. 

If bats are infected, they arouse 
more often during hibernation 
and that causes their fat reserves 
to be used up more quickly. 

Because they burn up their fat 
reserves, they become suscepti-
ble to starvation.

Molly Lichtner, the Eco-Club’s 
president, stated that “When the 
fungus infects the bats, it makes 
them use up twice as much ener-
gy during their hibernation. This 
causes some bats to die from 
suffocation. Hopefully, this bat 
box will become the house of a 
new colony that will be safe and 
WNS-free.”

Joann Corn, the advisor of 
Eco-Club said, “The bat box is 
a 2-by-3 box that we are hoping 
to attach to the elevated structure 
that is located in the archery 
field. This is behind Founder’s 
Hall as you walk a path toward 
Tyler State Park.”

“We’re hoping to team up with 
some of the woodwork students 
so they could help us build the 
bat box,” Corn stated.

The club meets every Thursday 

at 12:30pm at the Club Organi-
zation Office. They plan feature 
events, plant plants in the green-
house on campus, and clean up 
Tyler State Park every spring. 

The Eco-Club also partici-
pates in various events. They 
have protested the Endangered 
Species Coordination Act (House 

Bill No. 1576), and have assisted 
Bryant Holsenbeck last semester 
with the waterfall sculpture by 
collecting plastic bottles.

If you are interested in joining 
the Eco-Club and would like to 
help promote an eco-friendly 
environment, contact Joann Corn 
at joann.corn@bucks.edu. 

Batbox atached to a tree.                    PHOTO CREDIT: WIKIMEDIA COMMONS

By: Anna Merezhko
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Radio Bux is back and
 better than ever

By: Crystal Stout 
Centurion Staff

Bucks County Community 
College has jumped on the grow-
ing bandwagon of college radio 
with its revamp of Radio BUX. 

Benjamin Woodring, 21, who 
is a cinema and video major at 
Bucks, serves as President and 
Program Director for the station 
this fall. 

The station had its official 
launch on the first day of the fall 
semester, Wednesday, August 
26.  On opening day, the folks at 
Radio Bux offered free pretzels 
to students who visited the So-
larium broadcast booth to garner 
support for their new station. 

When asked about the turnout 
to their launch, Woodring much 
to his dismay was not thrilled 
overall, “It was enough to get 
people aware that we were here, 
but wasn’t what I was hoping 
for, unfortunately.” Despite this 
disappointment, the launch did 
help Radio BUX gain six new 
potential members. The six 
people who signed up will be 
trying their hand with their own 
practice shows.

As of now, the group running 
the station is made up of approx-
imately 10 to 15 members. Of-
ficers include club advisor, John 
Sheridan, previously mentioned 
President Benjamin Woodring, 
vice president Christopher Hun-
newell, Secretary Mayra Dietz, 
and treasurer Christopher Arco. 
Along with the officers, there 
are many others working hard to 
make the station a success. 

If listeners tune in on Tues-
days, between six and nine PM, 
they will be treated to the Antho-
ny Pinto show. The show, run by 
Anthony Pinto himself, features 
music that Woodring describes 
as “hippy music, general rock, 
and alternative rock. Rock you’re 
not going to hear on the radio.” 
For listeners who enjoy this sort 
of music, they’ll find it in good 
measure during this particular 
show. 

In the spirit of being a true 
variety station, Radio BUX also 

offers a segment called “Mowrey 
Music”. Hosted by Kyle Yeingst, 
this show focuses on the rap 
and hip-hop music that has been 
growing in popularity recently. 
Listeners can listen to Yeingst’s 
show on Tuesdays between the 
hours of one and three pm. 

The station doesn’t limit itself 
to music, either, and features 
quite a few talk shows as well. 
These shows include subjects 
to cater to all areas of interest 
across campus. “War Room 
Philly”, for example, is the 
station’s sports talk show. Hosted 
by Anthony Pinto and Keith 
Maliszewski, this show airs on 
Thursdays from 6-9 p.m. Listen-
ers can tune in then to get their 
sports news fix. 

For those that aren’t huge 
sports fans, Radio BUX offers 
a segment called “Ennui with 
Andy”. Hosted by Andrès Flores 
and Emily Brigham, this show 
airs on Monday, Wednesday, and 
Friday from 11am until 1 pm and 
focuses on cultural and social 
topics. 

To cater to the huge portion of 
the student body with interest in 
video gaming, Radio BUX also 
has a show called “All about the 
Bits”, which features video game 
talk and music. The host of this 
show, Woodring, expressed a fair 
bit of excitement in regards to 
this show, feeling that there are 
a very wide range of interesting 
topics to cover in this area. Re-
cently, the creator and president 
of famous gaming company 
Nintendo, Satoru Iwata, passed 
away and Radio BUX aired a 
tribute to him during “All About 
the Bits”. For more topics of this 
nature, listeners should tune in 
on Wednesdays, between six and 
nine pm.

Although these particular 
shows air at specific times, 
the station is up and running 
24 hours a day, streaming live 
music at radiobux.com/stream. 
Woodring assures his audience 
that along with the shows they 
currently have, “Many more 
shows are on the way!” In order 
for the station to grow, however, 
they need new people with new 
contributions.

The station is always open 
to people interested in getting 
involved. If someone has a 
topic they would like a talk show 
about, they are encouraged to 
contact the radio and pitch their 
idea. They will be started off 
with a weekly two hour block 
to see how it goes. Radio BUX 
members will assess how com-
fortable they are running their 
show and how listeners respond. 
If things go well, they will be 
given more time slots for their 
show. It is recommended that 
hosts include a co-host on their 
show, to help things run more 
smoothly. 

If running a talk show doesn’t 

sound appealing, there are many 
other ways to get involved in 
the station. The station is always 
looking for people to help out 
behind the scenes, working on 
their website or helping with 
the various others forms of tech. 
Woodring explains that “Anyone 
that is really good with audio 
production and editing would be 
very useful to us.”

Despite the challenges faced 
by the team, Woodring say that 
working on the station is “a lot 
of fun” and that the best part for 
him is “meeting new people.” 
The real issue facing the station 
is simply getting the attention of 
the student body, and forming a 
following. Reports have been op-
timistic in regards to the future of 
the station, with the majority of 
students believing that the station 
will be able to flourish so long as 
they put themselves out there and 
provide a variety of music. 

Some students were under the 
opinion that in order to gain at-
tention, the station ought to focus 
more on music that is popular in 
the mainstream media. How-
ever, Woodring explains that, 
in his opinion, “The position of 
college radio 
to not focus on 
the hits because 
that’s all that 
gets played on 
mainstream 
radio. College 
radio, for a long 
time, it’s been 
their reputation, 
they typically 
get stuff before 
it’s popular.” 

Woodring ex-
plains that it is 
his hope for the 
station to avoid 
the “hits” and 
focus on being 
“An outlet for 
smaller artists to 
get their name 
out there, get 
some recogni-
tion.” The sta-
tion explained 
that it would be 
entirely open 
to, and excited 
at the prospect, 
of airing music 
from student 

formed bands who would like 
some extra exposure for their 
music. 

If you or someone you know 
is looking to promote their 
band, hoping to join the team, or 
simply wanting to praise a song 
choice during one of the shows, 
Radio BUX has a plethora of 
media outlets where they can be 
reached. 

Woodring explains that “The 
text board is really our main way 
of getting people who are listen-
ing to interact with us.” Students 
who want to comment on the 
programming or suggest a song 
can simply send a text to 267-
705-5BUX. As an alternative, 
students can also reach the sta-
tion via their email, radiobux@
live.bucks.edu. 

Their other social media out-
lets include Facebook (facebook.
com/BUXRadio), their Twitter 
(@RadioBUX), their snapchat 
(RadioBUX), or their Instagram 
(BUXRadio). These platforms 
are mainly used for showing 
their audience what is going on 
with Radio BUX, and providing 
behind the scene pictures. 

Along with their website, 

http://radiobux.co/ , the station 
has done a marvelous job of 
putting themselves out there into 
the digital world. “At the website 
people can listen, see current 
news with the station, sign up 
for the station and check the 
show schedule” says Woodring. 
Although they do not have an 
actual am/fm station, the show 
is streaming live, 24/7 at http://
radiobux.co/stream.

In an age of iPods and digital 
downloads, radio stations are 
falling out of the limelight. For a 
generation who is accustomed to 
picking and choosing whatever 
song they want and hearing it 
instantly, the interest in randomly 
shuffled music chosen by strang-
ers has decreased significantly. 
Modern cars are fitted with AUX 
cords that allow drivers to play 
specific music off their phones. 

Yet, in this age of personalized 
music, a group of Bucks students 
have taken a stand to prove that 
video has not killed the radio 
star. All they need now are listen-
ers to join them in their pursuit 
to bring back radio and celebrate 
music in all its forms.
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National News 

700 E. Butler Ave. | Doylestown, PA 18901  

TRANSFERRING TO  
DELVAL WAS THE BEST  
DECISION OF MY LIFE

•  Transfer scholarships  
available

•  Articulation agreement  
offers guaranteed admission 
and core-to-core

•  More than 25 academic  
degrees

•  100% of our students  
receive real-world experience 
before graduation

“ I am using the hands-on  
experiences at DelVal to give 
me knowledge to explore what 
I may or may not want to do 
in my career. These experiences 
have helped prepare me for ‘the 
real world’ without feeling like  
I wasted several years of my life.”

  Francis Arnold ’16 
  Business Administration

> TRANSFER TUESDAY 
 September 29

 delval.edu/transfer 
 to apply, plan a visit or request information

Behind the store cages: 
The dangers of puppy mills 

BY MELISSA E. COHEN 
Centurion Staff

Puppy Mills confi ne puppies to 
small wire cages where they have 
little to no human socialization, a 
lack of adequate food and water, 
and can be found covered in their 
own feces.  Non-profi t animal or-
ganizations such as the Humane 
Society of the United States are 
working on spreading legislation 
and grass-root methods that will 
help “crack down” on Puppy 
Mills across the state of Pennsyl-
vania; warning the public of the 
dangers lurking behind some pet 
store cages. 

You walk into a local pet store 
and what do you see? Chances 
are, you were lured into the store 
by the charming puppy that you 
had seen in the window.  Store 
associates insist that the puppy 
is both healthy and ready for 
adoption. However, when you 
take the puppy home, you notice 
that he or she has many medical 
conditions, and you are spend-
ing an increasingly large sum of 
money to cover the costs of the 
dog’s medication and vet visits.

According to the Humane 
Society of the United States, 
Pennsylvania is considered to 
be one of the biggest puppy mill 
states in the country, with many 
mills found throughout Lancaster 
County.  Many of these dogs are 
transported to pet stores for a 
profi t, instead of being provided 
with the much needed compan-
ionship in local shelters.  In a 
puppy mill, adult dogs are used 
for breeding until they can no 
longer do so; they are then shot 
and killed by their breeders.  
These are common practices 
found among Amish puppy mill 
owners in Lancaster County.  

Currently, leaders in animal 
advocacy such as HSUS PA 
state Director, Kristen Tullo are 
working on effective strategies 
that will help pet stores such as 
Pets Plus in Bensalem, PA, adopt 
dogs from local area shelters, 

instead of puppy mill breeders. 
“This is a Corporate Policy 
Perspective”, Tullo mentions, 
“We have to crack down on 
Puppy Mills until they don’t 
exist, anymore”.  Other animal 
advocates such as Senator Roy 
Affl erbach, the former Mayor of 
Allentown and Humane Society 
Lobbyist, hold local meetings 
with Humane Society members 
about effective ways to prevent 
animal abuse, and are pushing to 
shut down mills through legisla-
tive efforts. 

“Puppy mills combine the 
worst aspects of industrialized 
husbandry and mass merchandis-
ing”, Senator Affl erbach notes, 
“In November of 2008, the PA 
legislature, with the support 
of Governor Ed Rendell, and 
after years of debate, passed 
legislation that succeeded in 
closing over 134 of the worst 
puppy mills, by requiring basic 
improvements for cage size, 
ventilation, temperature con-
trol, exercise, and vet exams”. 
However, he also mentions that 
mills such as these “continue to 
operate; some legally and others 
illegally”, through marketing and 
sales on the Internet. 

Senator Richard Alloway spon-
sors a Kennel License Bill which 
limits those whose kennel licens-
es have been revoked from get-
ting a new foothold in the kennel 
business. Additionally, Senator 

Stewart Greenleaf also sponsors 
a bill that seeks to strengthen 
the Puppy Lemon Law, which 
gives owners of puppy mill dogs 
10 days to document the dog’s 
medical illnesses.  

These are some of the ways 
that animal advocates and 
non-profi ts such as the HSUS are 
continuing to fi ght for the even-
tual shutting down of all puppy 
mills in Pennsylvania.

Senator Roy Affl erbach is 
doing his best to address public 
concerns.  However, with the 
sale approach that is still in effect 
in many pet stores receiving their 
dogs from puppy mills: 

“Unfortunately, those who 
think of animals as a commod-
ity rather than loving, feeling, 
companion beings will continue 
to treat them as nothing more 
than a way to make a fast dollar 
by playing to the good nature of 
pet loving consumer”. 

Other animal lobbyists and 
animal advocates are hopeful 
that through legislative efforts, 
and hands on approaches such as 
the ones being used by Tullo in 
Pet Stores, puppy mills will be 
swiftly shut down.  

 “Promoting adopting of 
shelter animals through pet stores 
is another effective method to 
interrupt the demand and supply 
chain from mills”, Senator Roy 
Affl erbach adds.  “By publiciz-
ing the realities of puppy mill 
exploitation, complete with 
photographs and, through focus-
ing on consumer protection and 
puppy lemon laws, advocates are 
able to expand the base of people 
opposing purchase and sale from 
mill operators”. 

Despite the diffi culties that 
come with keeping these safety 
methods in place, animal ad-
vocates are not giving up hope. 
As Kristen Tullo explains, “It is 
about working through grass-root 
approaches and legislation that 
will help shut down these puppy 
mills”.

Inside the cages of puppy mills.                                                                       PHOTO CREDIT: WIKIMEDIA COMMONS

“We have to 
crack down on 

Puppy Mills 
until they 

don’t exist, 
anymore.”

KRISTEN TULLO
HSUS PA state Director, 
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Jazz master visiting Bucks in October
By Colleen Gall
Centurion Staff

David Liebman, a renaissance 
man in contemporary jazz music 
for over 50 years, and his new 
group of musicians are coming to 
the Bucks Newtown Campus in 
October.

   Liebman is a saxophonist 
who has played and recorded 
music from hard rock to free 
jazz for over 5 decades. Ben 
Ratliff of the New York Times 
stated, “While others of his 60s 
generation have fallen off their 
ambition, Liebman has remained 
dogged about composition and 
trying different styles, he’s a 
fighter.”  

   Liebman has performed on 
over 500 recordings and has 
composed or collaborated on 
more than 200 compositions.  He 
is also featured on over several 
hundred original compositions.

   Downbeat Magazine wrote, 
“Liebman is among the most 
important saxophonists in con-
temporary music… a leader and 
artist of integrity and indepen-
dent direction.”  

In 1989, Liebman founded and 
became the Artistic Director of 
the International Association of 
Schools of Jazz, a worldwide 
network of schools in 40 coun-
tries.

   

The award-winning saxophon-
ist is a lecturer and author of sev-
eral books with multiple teaching 
DVDs.  His books vary from 
teaching about different types of 
jazz to milestone books about his 
life, including an autobiography.  
He also had journalistic contri-
butions and published chamber 
music.  

   Liebman created the group, 
Expansions, to look in the 
direction of “the present genera-

tion of jazz musicians who have 
been taught in conservatory and 
university settings.”  They travel 
to different colleges and univer-
sities to show how jazz can be 
changed and be freer to young 
college musicians.  

  Expansions play elements 
from free jazz and re-arrange-
ments of standards with complex 
signatures from new jazz artists.  
In 2014, their first recording 
“Samsara” was released by 

Whaling City Sounds.  The 
Expansions group consists of 
David Liebman, pianist Bobby 
Avey, reedman Matt Vashlishan, 
drummer Ale

Ritz, and bassist Tony Marino.
   The multiple Grammy nom-

inee has worked with other jazz 
masters such as Miles Davis and 
Elvin Jones. Liebman and the 
Expansions not only incorporates 
the musical influence Davis in 

their music but also introduces 
younger generation to this great 
jazz musician.  They are teaching 
young musicians to think outside 
of their classical box, encourage 
them to adopt new techniques.

     Having Liebman and the 
Expansions performed at Bucks 
will be a tremendous experience 
not only for the students but for 
the community as well.  Since 
Bucks has a growing Arts pro-
gram, a renowned jazz musician 
like Liebman will open student’s 
eyes and ears to new music.  The 
Expansions classic and inno-
vating approach will show new 
techniques that Bucks students 
could incorporate into their own 
music.  

   The community will have the 
opportunity to watch a master 
and up and coming musicians 
perform classical jazz with some 
new genres thrown into the mix.  
It will be a show you will not 
want to miss.

   The Expansions: The David 
Liebman Group will be perform-
ing on Saturday, Oct. 3rd 2015 at 
3:00 pm for a Masterclass at the 
Zlock Performing Arts Center 
at the Newtown Campus which 
is free and open for all.  There 
will be a second performance at 
7:30 pm and tickets are required.  
Tickets are $25/$10 for students, 
alumni, and seniors.  

Emily Brown takes Bucks “From the Ground Up” in art exhibit

By Angela Grabosky
Centurion Staff

Bucks is featuring the work of 
guest artist, Emily Brown, in a 
show called “From the Ground 
Up: Drawings by Emily Brown”.

The art show will take place 
at the Hicks art center now until 
October 17. Brown stated that 
she lived in Maine and was “born 
and raised mainly in Pennsylva-
nia countryside”. She has gone to 
numerous art schools, received 
various awards since 1999, and 
has been featured in solo exhibi-
tions since 2000. 

Fran Orlando, the director of 
the Artmobile-Hicks Art Center 
Gallery, said that picking Brown 
for the show was an “easy deci-
sion”. She continued to say that 

Brown’s work is fabulous and 
“fascinating on so many levels, 
with the gallery surrounding you, 
you can be transported to where 
she was, or a sense of where she 
was”. 

Brown uses sumi, a traditional 
East Asian medium that uses 
varying combinations of ink 
and water, to make her work. 
In contrast, her work is not 
traditional for her medium. Her 
nature pieces “bring us into the 
experience of seeing. Looking 
down, we see the piece of ground 
we stand on and where we are. 
Looking up and outward we see 
the world around us” according 
to the exhibit pamphlet. 

The Bucks website wrote that 

pieces in the show feature differ-
ent views of landscapes such as 
“views looking downward at the 
rocky, weedy ground, paired with 
views looking outward at the 
natural world of shaggy forests, 
fields, snags”.

The exhibit pamphlet compares 
the experience viewing Brown’s 
art with going on a hike. The 
large size of most of the pieces 
makes it easy to get lost in the 
landscape. 

Brown stated in the pamphlet 
that she “ could not have done 
the studio pieces without the 
primary experience of being 
out there (in the landscape) and 
absorbing it”. 

She tries to capture movement 

in her landscapes and describes 
this in the pamphlet, “Things in 
nature are ever changing. The 
nature and direction of light, 
movement, growth/blossoming/
disintegration of living things… 	
Making a picture that represents 
change is a challenge. I hope that 
the shifts in tone within areas 
and marks keep the viewer’s eye 
moving, and observations flow-
ing”. 

Brown achieves complex tones 
by “building an image out of 
marks” according to Director 
Orlando. Orlando explained that 
“the variety of tones that you see 
is based on the amount of water 
with the ink” and Brown “starts 
off light and builds the depth 

using less water with the ink”.  
Brown will be here for artist 

talk on Wednesday September 30 
from 3-4 p.m. at Penn Hall room 
257. The gallery reception is on 
the same day from 5 to 7 p.m. 
with the curator’s talk, hosted by 
Susan Hagan, at 6:10 p.m. Hagan 
is an art critic and teacher in the 
art department. The artist talk 
and reception are free and open 
to the public. 

Orlando encourages students 
to bring their family and friends. 
She stated, “I would hope the 
students, faculty, and staff see 
it (Hicks Gallery) as a place to 
come and gather or just have 
some quiet time alone, especially 
at a calming show like this”. 

Emily Brown’s exhibit in the Hick’s art center.   PHOTO CREDIT: SARA SANDERSON
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High hopes for the 
Eagles this year

By: John Gannon 
Centurion Staff 

At the finale of the NFL pre-
season the Philadelphia Eagles 
ended with a 24-18 loss to the 
New York Jets. Though they 
lost, expectations are high in this 
upcoming season for the Birds. 

With a 3-1 record in the pre-
season the Eagles did fairly well, 
blowing teams like the Green 
Bay Packers out of the water 39-
26, the Baltimore Ravens 40-17, 
and the Indianapolis Colts 36-10. 

The offense is looking great 
with a healthy amount of threats 
in the lineup. Having four solid 
threats from the backfield on 
offense with guys like Demarco 
Murray, Ryan Matthews and 
Darren Sproles. 

Really, the only questionable 
spot is the quarterback position; 
with Sam Bradford having a 
history of knee issues, and Mark 
Sanchez struggling to win games 
last season. Recently acquired, 
Stephen Morris, has two-and-
a-half years under his belt as a 
starter in the NFL, so could he be 
the guy?

Eric Ervin, 18, from Holland, 
thinks they’ll improve, “I think 
they will at least be better than 
last year and hopefully make a 
playoff run.” 

Pat McGowan, 18, from 
Churchville, also seems to think 
they’ll do well stating confident-
ly that “they will win the NFC 
East this season.” 

The big question this year 
is Bradford- can he really stay 
healthy? Matt Stewart, 18, from 
Churchville said, “If Bradford 
stays healthy I think he can have 
a positive impact.” 

If Bradford does fail to stay 
healthy, the issue will be who 
the back-up quarterback will be. 
Dan Buchnik, 18, from Richboro 
seems to think that Sanchez is 
the guy, stating “Bradford may 
not be as important as Sanchez 
is to the team but only time will 
tell.” 

Pat McGowan, 18, from 
Churchville, stated, “The X-Fac-
tor this season is definitely going 
to be the defense.” We’ve shown 
that we can put up big numbers 
on offense, now the issue is 
defense. 

With the way our offense is set 
they basically march down the 
field rapidly. This means that the 
defense is on the field for much 
longer throughout the game, so 
we’ve got to be able to get stops 
more consistently. 

The Eagles were last in the 
NFL in time of possession last 

2015 Philadelphia Phillies: Putting the Pieces Together
by Sean Smith
Centurion Staff

The 2015 season has been a 
long and painful season for the 
organization as well as the loyal 
fans of the team.  Despite this, 
the season can be viewed as a 
successful start to a franchise 
rebuild.

As of Sep. 9, 2015, the Phillies 
own the worst record of any 
team in Major League Baseball.  
Many fans were expecting a 
down year from the franchise, 
but it may not be so bad after all. 

Despite the terrible record, 
the organization and its fan base 
can view this season largely as a 
success.

Donavin Williams, an 18-year-
old nursing major from Bensa-
lem said, “This season has been 
tough to watch, but it’s good to 
know that there is reason to still 
follow the team going forward.”

The Phillies have made sweep-
ing changes across the organi-
zation.  Among these changes 
are the announcement that Andy 
McPhail will be the team’s new 
President starting at the end of 

this season.  
This season will be the final 

one for Amaro, as it has just been 
announced that his contract will 
not be renewed in the upcoming 
season.  Scott Proefrock, the 
assistant general manager, will 
be replacing him.

Amaro has been heavily scru-
tinized by fans of the team for 
years now, and for good reason.  
Fans feel as if he has not put the 
team in a great position to suc-
ceed on the field.  Despite this, 
he has had a pretty good season 
when it comes to the moves he 
has made.

Those moves date back to the 
offseason when he decided to 
trade longtime shortstop Jim-
my Rollins to the Los Angeles 
Dodgers, and outfielder Marlon 
Byrd to the Cincinnati Reds.  In 
those deals he received three 
good pitching prospects in Zach 
Eflin, Tom Windle, and Ben 
Lively.

He then traded Jonathon 
Papelbon, and Cole Hamels prior 
to the Jul. 31 non-waiver trade 
deadline.  For Papelbon, the 

Phillies received a young pitch-
ing prospect named Nick Pivetta.  

For Hamels, he acquired a 
package of five prospects in-
cluding pitchers Jake Thompson, 
Alec Asher, and Jerad Eickoff, 
outfielder Nick Williams, and 
catcher Jorge Alfaro. They also 
received a veteran pitcher in 
Matt Harrison.

	 Thompson, Williams, 
and Alfaro are all rated in the 
top one hundred prospects of 
baseball by Baseball America 
and other prospect ranking sites. 
While Asher and Eickoff have 
already made their major league 
debuts with the Phillies.

Ryan Nolan, a 17-year-old 
nursing major from Bensalem 
said, “It’s sad to see the players 
that were vital to a championship 
go, but these moves are what’s 
best for the team.”

These moves have moved the 
Phillies up from having the 23 
ranked prospect system in base-
ball to the 8 best, also based on 
Baseball American.  

Manoj Kumar, a 17-year-old 

criminal justice major from Ben-
salem said, “It is great to see the 
organization moving in a new di-
rection and trying to break from 
the past and move forward with a 
new group of young players.”

In addition to the moves made 
during the season, the Phillies’ 
minor league team finished the 
regular season in first place in 

their respective division and are 
hoping to make a lengthy playoff 
run. 

So, despite an unsuccessful 
season on the field for the Phil-
lies, there are many reasons to 
call this season an organizational 
success.

season, with only 26 minutes and 
40 seconds on the field. Their 
secondary last season was the 
worst aspect to the team; the 
team’s starting cornerbacks had 
19 penalties and the defense had 
58. Cary Williams and Bradley 
Fletcher alone allowed more 
than 1,800 passing yards and 14 

touchdowns. 
Eric also added that “The 

X-Factor is building a stronger 
defense.” The Eagles could be 
legitimate Super Bowl contend-
ers in the 2015 season if they im-
prove on their negative aspects 
from last season. 

With a loss to the Atlanta Fal-

cons in their season opener, they 
head the Philadelphia to play the 
Dallas Cowboys sunday night. 
With Dallas losing key Wide 
Reciever Dez Bryant, the Eagles 
secondary may have a chance to 
rebound. 

Darren Sproles, 26, runs the football.                                                                 PHOTO CREDIT: WIKIMEDIA COMMONS

Despite Eagles season opener loss 
to Atlanta, Eagles exude confidence 
going forward
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